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SCT PERFORMANCE, LLC LIMITED WARRANTY 

• What Does This Warranty Cover?  This warranty covers any defects or malfunctions in your 
SCT tuning product within the warranty period set forth below, subject to the following 
conditions and limitations. 

• How Long Does The Coverage Last?  This warranty lasts for a period of one (1) year following 
the date of sale by SCT of the product to the original SCT dealer/distributor; provided, however, 
the duration of this warranty will be extended to one (1) year from the date of original purchase 
by the consumer from the SCT dealer/distributor so long as the consumer submits the required 
online registration information within thirty (30) days of purchase, as provided below. All implied 
warranties, including warranties of merchantability and fitness for a particular purpose are 
limited to the warranty period set forth above. 

• What Will SCT Do?  SCT will, at its option and as its sole obligation under this warranty, 
replace, repair or refund the purchase price of any SCT product that has a defect(s) in 
manufacturing, material and/or workmanship provided that SCT is notified of the claim within 
the warranty period provided herein. SCT will not be liable for, nor will it reimburse the 
consumer for any fees, charges or expenses for shipping and/or handling costs associated with the 
return to SCT of any defective products sent in for replacement or repair. 

• What Does This Warranty Not Cover? Any damage and/or other problem(s) caused by abuse, 
misuse, neglect, vandalism, accident, act of God (e.g., flood, fire, lightning), or other cause 
beyond the reasonable control of SCT is/are not covered. Also, any damage or problem resulting 
from faulty or improper installation is not covered and shall be the responsibility of the installer. 
SCT IS NOT LIABLE FOR AND HEREBY EXCLUDES ANY AND ALL INCIDENTAL, 
SPECIAL OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES RELATING TO THE PRODUCTS COVERED 
BY THIS WARRANTY. This is the consumer’s exclusive warranty and is in lieu of all other 
warranties, express or implied, except as may be required by applicable law.  Without limiting 
the generality of the foregoing, SCT shall not be liable for any breach of any other written or oral 
warranties given to the consumer by any third party(ies) such as those (if any) given to the 
consumer by dealers or distributors of the products.  

• How Do You Get Service? In order to be eligible for service under this warranty you MUST 
complete the online registration information within thirty (30) days of purchase. To register your 
SCT product, please log on to www.sctflash.com, click on “Register Products” and follow the 
simple steps provided on the website. If you do not have internet access, or encounter difficulties 
with the online registration process, please contact SCT at 407-774-2447. To initiate a claim 
under this warranty, you can call 407-774-2447 and instructions will be provided. 

• Can This Warranty Be Transferred? This warranty is not transferable and applies only to the 
consumer who originally purchased the SCT product. 

• How Does State Law Apply?  This warranty gives you specific legal rights, and you may also 
have other rights which may vary from state to state.  Pertinent state law shall control for what 
period of time following the sale a consumer may seek a remedy under the implied warranty of 
merchantability or fitness for a particular purpose. Some states do not allow the exclusion or 
limitation of incidental or consequential damages so the above limitation or exclusion may not 
apply to you. 


